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ITS Cloud Manager Software  
Fleet Management / QDS / Smart Work Zone Control 
 

 

 

  

American Signal's ITS Cloud 
Manager Software gives you 
full control of your entire PCMS 
fleet from a single screen. 
Group your signs by job, by 
user, or by territory. Assign 
your own designations for quick 
reference, or use the ID Amsig's 
ITS Cloud Manager provides 
you. 

Auto-positioning via integrated 
GPS let's you know where your 
equipment is and the 
operational status of your 
signs. The simple color code 
system gives you an immediate 
idea about signs that need 
attention. Instant access to an 
individual sign provides 
diagnostic, positional, and 
display information. 
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American Signal's ITS Cloud 
Manager Software provides 
simple and easy-to-navigate 
control screens for message 
creation, while also giving you a 
full range of functionality and 
customization. 

Quickly and easily setup 
Notification Groups to 
immediately learn about 
upcoming trailer voltage concerns 
and unauthorized movements. 

Let us manage your Queue 
Detection System to provide 
messages based on speed, 
volume, or occupancy. Smart 
Work Zone management has 
never been easier for you with 
Amsig's ITS Cloud Manager. 


